

**DEPARTMENT**

Party/Vendor Name: Affinity Systems, LLC, dba Security 101  
Party/Vendor Contact Person: Scott Robitzer Contact Phone: 704-561-3169  
Party/Vendor Address to mail contract to (be sure this is accurate or it could delay the processing of this contract):  
Address: 4301-S Stuart Andrew Boulevard City: Charlotte State: NC Zip: 28217  
Department: Facilities Department Amount: \$670,806.62

Purpose: IP Camera Platform Upgrade-Multiple Locations (Refer to Exhibit 1) CCFP VR 1 funds  
Budget Code(s) (put comma between multiple codes): 4.9012.712.541.SCH 121.

TYPE OF CONTRACT: (Please Check One)  New  Renewal  Amendment Effective Date: \_\_\_\_\_

This document has been reviewed and approved by the Department Head as to technical content.

Project Manager Daniel Laves Date: 7-25-16  
Assistant Director [Signature] Date: 7-25-16  
Director of Facilities [Signature] Date: 7-25-16  
Fund Originator Signature [Signature] Date: 7-26-16

**CENTRAL PURCHASING**

Type of Contract:  Award Bid  Sole Source  Piggyback  Emergency  Amendment  As To Form Other: \_\_\_\_\_  
Attached Documentation:  Bid Tabulation  Certificate of Insurance  Sole Source Documentation  Emergency Documentation

This document has been reviewed and approved by the Central Purchasing Director.  
Central Purchasing Director Signature: [Signature] Date: 7/26/16

**RISK MANAGEMENT**

Date Received \_\_\_\_\_

Include the following coverage:  CGL  Auto  W/C Professional  Property  Pollution  Non-Profit  Not Required  
Hold Contract pending receipt of Certificate of Insurance  Notes: \_\_\_\_\_

Risk Manager's Signature [Signature] Date: 7-26-16

**INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY DIRECTOR (IF APPLICABLE)**

Date Received \_\_\_\_\_

(Applicable only for hardware/software purchase or related Information Technology services)  Non-Applicable  
This document has been reviewed and approved by the Information Systems Director as to technical content. NA

IT Director's Signature \_\_\_\_\_ Date: \_\_\_\_\_

**BUDGET AND FINANCE**

Date Received \_\_\_\_\_

Yes  No \_\_\_\_\_ Sufficient funds are available in the proper category to pay for this expenditure. \$ 670,806.62  
This contract is conditioned upon appropriation by the Union County Board of Commissioners of sufficient funds for each request for services/goods.

Notes: \_\_\_\_\_  
Finance Director's Signature [Signature] Date: 7/27/16

**ATTORNEY**

Date Received 8/1/16

Date department needs contract back from attorney: \_\_\_\_\_  
This document has been reviewed as to form and approved by the Attorney and stamp affixed thereto: Yes  No  OPERA BY LES and 7/26/16 2/12

Attorney's Signature: \_\_\_\_\_ Date: \_\_\_\_\_

**UCPS SUPERINTENDENT**

Date Received 7-28-16

This document has been reviewed and approved by the UCPS Superintendent. Yes  No

Superintendent's Signature [Signature] Date: 8/1/16

**BOARD OF EDUCATION**

Agenda Date: 8-2-16 Date Received 7-28-16

Yes  No  N/A  Approved by Board of Education at meeting of 8-2-16

Board Of Education Chairman Signature [Signature] Date: 8/1/16



**CONTRACT FOR SERVICES  
IP CAMERA PLATFORM UPGRADE  
7-9709702**

This Contract is made and entered into this 2<sup>nd</sup> day of August 2016 between The Union County Board of Education ("UCBOE") located at 400 North Church Street, Monroe, North Carolina 28112 and Affinity Systems, LLC, dba Security 101 located at 4301-S Stuart Andrew Boulevard, Charlotte, North Carolina 28217 ("Contractor").

For and in consideration of the mutual promises set forth in this Contract, the parties do mutually agree as follows:

1. Obligations of Contractor - The Contractor agrees to provide all services as required to fully, timely and properly complete the IP Camera Platform Upgrade as more particularly described as Alternate 1 in the proposal document attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference as Exhibit 1 (the "Services").

The Contractor agrees to coordinate its Services with the work of any other separate contractors or with the work of the UCBOE's own forces to avoid delaying or interfering with their work. The Contractor further agrees to inform the UCBOE on a regular basis or at the UCBOE's request of the progress of the Services.

Unless otherwise provided, the Contractor shall secure and pay for all permits, licenses, or inspections necessary for the proper execution and completion of the Services; shall comply with all laws, ordinances, or regulations bearing on the performance of the Services; shall enforce good order and discipline among his employees and subcontractors on the Project; and shall keep the Project reasonably free from waste materials or rubbish resulting from the Contractor's operations.

The Contractor warrants that the Contractor has visited the locations of the Project and is familiar with all field conditions bearing upon the Contractor's performance of the Services; that the materials and equipment furnished under the Contract are of good quality and new (unless otherwise permitted); that the Services meet or exceeds the standards ordinarily observed in the industry; and that the Services conforms to the requirements of the Contract and to all applicable codes, ordinances, laws, or regulations. The Contractor further warrants and promises that the Services shall be free from defects and nonconformities in materials and workmanship for a period of one year (unless stated otherwise in Exhibit 1) from the later of the Date of Completion or such date as the Contractor actually completes all the Services. During such period the Contractor will remedy at Contractor's expense nonconformities or defects in the Services within a reasonable time after receiving notice thereof from UCBOE.

In addition to the indemnification obligations contained in the attached terms and conditions to this Contract, the Contractor further agrees to defend and indemnify the UCBOE from and against all claims, damages, losses, and expenses, including reasonable attorneys' fees, arising out of the Contractor's failure to pay subcontractors or materials suppliers.

The Contractor agrees that the UCBOE may order changes in the general scope of the Services, including additions, deletions, and similar revisions. The parties agree to adjust the Contract Price and Date of Completion to reflect the effects of

such changes, which adjustments shall be authorized only upon execution of a written change order (a "Change Order"). In case of emergency or extenuating circumstances or if a construction contingency is provided as stated below, approval of changes may be obtained verbally by telephone or field orders approved by all parties, then shall be substantiated in writing as outlined under normal procedures.

The UCBOE may issue written Change Orders to the Contractor directing a change in the Services. The amount of any increase or decrease in the Contract Price shall be by mutual acceptance of a total amount supported by sufficient data and information to substantiate the change. If the UCBOE and Contractor do not mutually agree on the amount of the change in the Contract Price, the Contractor will proceed with the Services described in the Change Order and the UCBOE will pay the reasonable costs of any additional work, including a reasonable amount for the Contractor's overhead and profit. Any decrease in Contract Price for a decrease in the Services will be the reasonable costs of the Services deleted, including a reasonable amount for the decrease in the Contractor's overhead.

Asbestos may or may not be present at the project site. In accordance with the Asbestos Hazard Emergency Response Act (AHERA) the UCBOE has had an Asbestos Management Plan (AMP) prepared for this site. A copy of the AMP is available at the UCPS Facilities Department or at the project site. The AMP is designed to document (to the best of the Owner's ability) the asbestos containing building materials (ACBM) or presumed asbestos containing materials (PACM) present at the project site. It is incumbent upon the Contractor to review the AMP to insure his/her staff does not come in contact or otherwise disturb the ACBM/PACM. The Contractor is to notify all their subcontractors and other staff involved with the project of the AMP so they may also avoid being exposed to and /or disturbing any ACBM/PACM during construction. It shall be understood that by executing an agreement between the UCBOE and Contractor that the Contractor has made this review and has notified all staff involved with this project of the availability of the AMP.

The UCBOE and Contractor recognize that time is of the essence to this Agreement and that the UCBOE will suffer financial loss if the work is not completed within the times specified herein. Both parties also recognize the delays, difficulties and expense involved in proving, in a legal or arbitration proceeding, the actual loss suffered by the UCBOE if the Work is not completed on time. Accordingly, in lieu of requiring such proof, the UCBOE and Contractor agree that as liquidated damages for delay (but not as a penalty) the Contractor shall pay to the UCBOE for each day in excess of the term allowed for completion of the Work, the Contractor shall pay to the UCBOE the sum of \$500.00 as liquidated damages.

The Contractor shall indemnify and hold harmless UCBOE, its officers, agents, employees and assigns from and against all claims, losses, costs, damages, expenses, attorneys' fees and liability that any of them may sustain (a) arising out of the Contractor's failure to comply with any applicable law, ordinance, regulation, or industry standard or (b) arising directly or indirectly out of the Contractor's performance or lack of performance of the terms and conditions of this Contract.

The Contractor certifies that it currently has and agrees to purchase and maintain during its performance under this Contract the following insurance from one or more insurance companies acceptable to UCBOE and authorized to do business in the State of North Carolina:

Automobile

The Contractor shall maintain bodily injury and property damage liability insurance covering all owned, non-owned and hired automobiles. If the Contractor is not an individual, the policy limits of such insurance shall not be less than \$1,000,000 combined single limit each person/each occurrence. If the Contractor is an individual, the policy limits of such insurance shall not be less than a combined single limit of \$100,000 each person/\$300,000 each accident – bodily injury/\$50,000 each accident – property damage.

Commercial General Liability

The Contractor shall maintain commercial general liability insurance that shall protect the Contractor from claims of bodily injury or property damage which arise from performance under this Contract. This insurance shall include coverage for contractual liability. If the Contractor is not an individual, the policy limits of such insurance shall not be less than \$1,000,000 combined single limit each occurrence/annual aggregate. If the Contractor is an individual, the policy limits of such insurance shall not be less than \$300,000 combined single limit each occurrence/annual aggregate.

Worker's Compensation and Employers' Liability Insurance

If applicable to the Contractor, the Contractor shall meet the statutory requirements of the State of North Carolina for worker's compensation coverage and employers' liability insurance.

**Failure to furnish insurance certificates or to maintain such insurance shall be a default under this Contract and shall be grounds for immediate termination of this Contract.**

This contract does not grant the Contractor the right or the exclusive right to provide specified services to UCBOE. Similar services may be obtained from sources other than the Contractor (or not at all) at the discretion of the UCBOE.

The Contractor shall begin work immediately upon receipt of purchase order in accordance with instructions from UCBOE. The Contractor agrees to perform the Services in a timely, complete, and professional manner and in accordance with the terms and conditions of this Contract.

The Contractor represents and warrants that (i) it is duly qualified and licensed to provide the Services, (ii) it will provide the Services in a manner consistent with the level of care and skill ordinarily exercised by contractors providing similar services under similar conditions, (iii) it possesses sufficient experience, personnel, and resources to complete the Services, (iv) it shall perform the Services in compliance with applicable laws, statutes, ordinances, codes, orders, rules and regulations, and (v) its reports, if any, shall be complete, accurate, and unambiguous.

2. Obligations of UCBOE. UCBOE agrees to pay the Contractor for services as follows:

	Budget Account No. :
(i) Total Not to Exceed	\$670,806.62

Contractor may submit payment requests on a monthly basis for the value of work completed minus 5% until project is 50% complete. Retainage will be applied as authorized in NCGS 143-134.1.

3. Project Coordinator. Daniel Larres is designated as the Project Coordinator for the UCBOE. The Project Coordinator shall be the UCBOE's representative in connection with the Contractor's performance under this Contract. The UCBOE has complete discretion in replacing the Project Coordinator with another person of its choosing.
4. Contractor Supervisor. Scott Robitzer is designated as the Contractor Supervisor for the Contractor. The Contractor Supervisor is fully authorized to act on behalf of the Contractor in connection with this Contract. Substitution of Contract Supervisor must be presented to Project Coordinator with a minimum of 24 hour notice and shall include contact information of the newly selected Contractor Supervisor.
5. Terms and Methods of Payment. UCBOE will make payment after invoices are approved on a net 30 day basis. Failure to submit all required documents will delay payment. UCBOE will not pay for services or materials in advance without the prior approval of the Finance Officer.
6. Additional Provisions. Contractor agrees to the Standard Terms and Conditions set forth as Attachment A attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference.
7. Counterpart Execution. This Contract may be executed and recorded in two or more counterparts, each of which shall be deemed an original and all of which, when taken together, shall constitute one and the same instrument. Each party shall be entitled to rely upon executed copies of this Contract transmitted by facsimile or electronic "PDF" to the same and full extent as the originals.

**[THE REST OF THIS PAGE HAS BEEN LEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY]  
[SIGNATURES ON NEXT PAGE]**



Exhibit List:

Attachment A: UCBOE Standard Terms and Conditions

Exhibit 1: Proposal Document /Scope of Services



**Attachment A**  
**STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS**

1. Contract Documents. Contractor's acknowledgment of the terms hereof or Contractor's shipment or performance, constitutes an agreement to (i) all terms and conditions set forth or referenced herein, (ii) any attachments hereto, (iii) any applicable solicitation documentation (including without limitation any request for proposals or invitation for bids or Contractor's response thereto) that deal with the same subject matter as this contract, and (iv) any other terms and conditions of a written agreement signed by Contractor and The Union County Board of Education ("UCBOE") that deals with the same subject matter as this Order (collectively, the "Contract Documents"). The terms and provisions set forth in the Contract Documents shall constitute the entire agreement between Contractor and UCBOE with respect to the purchase by UCBOE of the (i) goods ("Goods") and/or (ii) services provided or work performed ("Services") as described in the Contract Documents. The agreements set forth in the Contract Documents are sometimes referred to herein as the "Contract." In the event of any conflict between any terms and conditions of the Contract Documents, the terms and conditions most favorable to UCBOE shall control. This Order constitutes an offer by UCBOE and expressly limits acceptance to the terms and conditions stated herein. No additional or supplemental provision or provisions in variance herewith that may appear in Contractor's quotation, acknowledgment, invoice, or in any other communication from Contractor to UCBOE shall be deemed accepted by or binding on UCBOE. UCBOE hereby expressly rejects all such provisions which supplement, modify or otherwise vary from the terms of the Contract Documents, and such provisions are superseded by the terms and conditions stated in the Contract Documents, unless and until UCBOE's authorized representatives expressly assent, in writing, to such provisions. Stenographic and clerical errors and omissions by UCBOE are subject to correction.
2. Quantities. Shipments must equal exact amounts ordered unless otherwise agreed in writing by UCBOE. The award of a term contract neither implies nor guarantees any minimum or maximum purchases.
3. Safety Data Sheets. Safety Data Sheets must be provided with shipment of all chemicals.
4. Prices. If Contractor's price or the regular market price of any of the Goods or Services covered hereunder is lower than the price stated in the Contract Documents on the date of shipment of such Goods or Services, Contractor agrees to give UCBOE the benefit of such lower price on any such Goods or Services. In no event shall Contractor's price be higher than the price last quoted or last charged to UCBOE unless otherwise agreed in writing. No charges for transportation, boxing, crating, etc. are allowable unless such charges are included in the Contract Documents.
5. Invoices. It is understood and agreed that orders will be shipped at the established Contract prices in effect on dates orders are placed. Invoicing at variance with this provision may subject the Contract to cancellation. Applicable North Carolina sales tax shall be invoiced as a separate item. Invoices shall be sent to UCBOE's accounts payable department with a copy to the UCBOE Project Coordinator.
6. Freight on Board. All shipments of Goods are FOB destination unless otherwise stated in the Contract Documents.
7. Payment Terms. Payment terms are Net 30 days after receipt of correct invoice or acceptance of Goods or Services, whichever is later.
8. Condition and Packaging. Unless otherwise provided by special terms and conditions or specifications, it is understood and agreed that any item offered or shipped has not been sold or used for any purpose and shall be in first class condition. All containers/packaging shall be suitable for handling, storage or shipment.

9. Delays in Shipment. Time and date of delivery are of the essence, except when delay is due to causes beyond Contractor's reasonable control and without Contractor's fault or negligence.
10. Risk of Loss. Contractor shall have the risk of loss of and damage to the Goods subject to the Contract Documents until such Goods are delivered to the destination and accepted by UCBOE or its nominee.
11. Rejection. All Goods and Services shall be received subject to UCBOE's inspection. Goods or Services that are defective in workmanship or material or otherwise not in conformity with the requirements of the Contract Documents may be rejected and returned at Contractor's expense or may be accepted at a reduced price. UCBOE may require Contractor to promptly replace or correct any rejected Goods or Services and, if Contractor fails to do so, UCBOE may contract with a third party to replace such Goods and Services and charge Contractor the additional cost.
12. Compliance with All Laws. Contractor warrants that all performance hereunder shall be in accordance with all applicable federal, state and local laws, regulations and orders.
13. Compliance with UCBOE Policies. During the term of this Contract, Contractor agrees to comply with all UCBOE imposed policies, rules and regulations while on UCBOE property and guarantees strict compliance by all of its employees, agents and subcontractors with such policies, rules and regulations. UCBOE will make available to Contractor copies of other applicable UCBOE policies, rules and regulations upon Contractor's request. Upon request by UCBOE, Contractor and its applicable employees and agents will execute UCBOE's standard documents reflecting the obligation to comply with applicable policies, rules and regulations. The requirements of this Section shall apply continuously during the term of this Contract and shall not be limited to normal working hours. Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, Contractor shall be responsible for its acts or omissions in connection with the safety of all persons and property where any Goods and Services or other work are being performed and during performance of such Goods and Services or work. No act, service, drawing review or construction review by UCBOE or its representatives is intended to include review of the adequacy of Contractor's safety measures in, on or near UCBOE's premises.
14. Warranties. Contractor warrants that all Goods and Services delivered hereunder will be free from defects in materials and workmanship and will conform strictly to the specifications, drawings, or samples specified or furnished. This warranty shall survive any inspection, delivery, acceptance or payment by UCBOE of the Goods and Services and shall run to UCBOE and any user of the Goods or Services. This express warranty is in addition to Contractor's implied warranties of merchantability and fitness for a particular purpose which shall not be disclaimed. In addition to any other rights available at law or equity, UCBOE shall be entitled to all rights and remedies provided by the Uniform Commercial Code, Chapter 25 of the North Carolina General Statutes, for breach of express warranties and implied warranties of merchantability or fitness for a particular purpose, including but not limited to consequential and incidental damages.
15. Termination for Convenience. UCBOE may terminate this Contract at any time at its complete discretion by five (5) calendar day notice in writing from the UCBOE to the Contractor. If the Contract is terminated by the UCBOE in accordance with this paragraph, the Contractor will be paid in an amount which bears the same ratio to the total compensation as does the service actually performed to the total service originally contemplated in this Contract.
16. Termination for Default.  
If Contractor fails to perform its obligations timely and in conformance with the requirements of this contract, UCBOE shall give Contractor written notice of the default and intent to terminate if the default is not cured within ten (10) calendar days to the satisfaction of UCBOE.

All finished or unfinished deliverable items under this contract prepared by the Contractor shall become the property of UCBOE, and the Contractor shall be entitled to receive payment for any satisfactory work completed on such materials. Notwithstanding, the Contractor shall not be relieved of liability to UCBOE for damages sustained by UCBOE by virtue of any breach of the agreement, and UCBOE may withhold any payment due the Contractor for the purpose of setoff until such time as the breach is cured or the exact amount of damages due UCBOE from such breach can be determined.

In case of default by the Contractor, UCBOE may procure the services from other sources and hold the Contractor responsible for any excess cost incurred.

Upon the entering of a judgment of bankruptcy of insolvency by or against the Contractor, UCBOE may terminate this contract for cause.

17. Contract Funding. It is understood and agreed between the Contractor and the UCBOE that the UCBOE's obligation under this Contract is contingent upon the availability of appropriated funds from which payment for Contract purposes can be made. The execution of this contract by UCBOE is assurance that sufficient funds have been appropriated for the current fiscal year budget. Should such funds not be appropriated or allocated, this Contract may be immediately terminated by either party. UCBOE shall give prompt written notice to the Contractor if funds are not available. The UCBOE shall not be liable to the Contractor for damages of any kind (general, special, or exemplary) as a result of such termination.
18. Indemnification. Contractor shall indemnify and hold harmless UCBOE, its officers, agents, employees and assigns from and against all claims, losses, costs, damages, expenses, attorneys' fees and liability that any of them may sustain (a) arising out of Contractor's failure to comply with any applicable law, ordinance, regulation, or industry standard or (b) arising directly or indirectly out of Contractor's performance or lack of performance of the terms and conditions of the Contract. In the event that any Goods or Services sold and delivered or sold and performed under the Contract Documents shall be defective in any respect whatsoever, Contractor shall indemnify and save harmless UCBOE, its officers, agents, employees and assigns from all loss or the payment of all sums of money by reason of all accidents, injuries or damages to persons or property that shall happen or occur in connection with the use or sale of such Goods or Services and are contributed to by said condition. In the event Contractor, its employees, agents, subcontractors and or lower-tier subcontractors enter premises occupied by or under the control of UCBOE in the performance of the Contract Documents, Contractor agrees that it will indemnify and hold harmless UCBOE, its officers, agents, employees and assigns, from any loss, costs, damage, expense or liability by reason of property damage or personal injury of whatsoever nature or kind arising out of, as a result of, or in connection with such entry.
19. Insurance. Unless such insurance requirements are waived or modified by UCBOE or UCBOE's Department of Insurance and Risk Management ("DIRM"), Contractor certifies that it currently has and agrees to purchase and maintain during its performance under the Contract the following insurance from one or more insurance companies acceptable to UCBOE and authorized to do business in the State of North Carolina: Automobile - Contractor shall maintain bodily injury and property damage liability insurance covering all owned, non-owned and hired automobiles. The policy limits of such insurance shall not be less than \$1,000,000 combined single limit each person/each occurrence. Commercial General Liability - Contractor shall maintain commercial general liability insurance that shall protect Contractor from claims of bodily injury or property damage which arise from performance under the Contract. This insurance shall include coverage for contractual liability. The policy limits of such insurance shall not be less than \$1,000,000 combined single limit each occurrence/annual aggregate. Worker's Compensation and Employers' Liability Insurance - If applicable to Contractor, Contractor shall

meet the statutory requirements of the State of North Carolina for worker's compensation coverage and employers' liability insurance. Contractor shall also provide any other insurance or bonding specifically recommended in writing by the DIRM or required by applicable law. Certificates of such insurance shall be furnished by Contractor to UCBOE and shall contain the provision that UCBOE be given 30 days' written notice of any intent to amend or terminate by either Contractor or the insuring company. Failure to furnish insurance certificates or to maintain such insurance shall be a default under the Contract and shall be grounds for immediate termination of the Contract.

20. Accounting Procedures. The Contractor shall comply with accounting and fiscal management procedures prescribed by the UCBOE to apply to this Contract. The Contractor shall assure such fiscal control and accounting procedures as may be necessary for proper disbursement of and accounting for all project funds. The Contractor shall assure that all funds received by it pursuant to this Contract will be used only to support the cost of those activities described in this Contract.
21. Improper Payments. The Contractor shall assume all risks attendant to any improper expenditure of funds under this Contract. The Contractor shall refund to the UCBOE any payment made pursuant to this Contract if it is subsequently determined by audit that such payment was improper under any applicable law, regulation or procedure. The Contractor shall make such refunds within 30 days after the UCBOE notifies the Contractor in writing that a payment has been determined to be improper.
22. Contract Transfer. The Contractor shall not assign, subcontract or otherwise transfer any interest in this Contract without the prior written approval of the UCBOE. In the event UCBOE approves the Contractor to assign, subcontract or other methods of transferring the interest of this Contract, the Contractor shall warrant all work to be performed in accordance to the contract documents by an individual or company that is qualified and properly licensed in the state of North Carolina to perform such work.
23. Contract Personnel. The Contractor agrees that it has, or will secure at its own expense, all personnel required to perform the services set forth in this Contract.
24. Key Personnel. The Contractor shall not substitute for key personnel assigned to the performance of this Contract without prior written approval from the UCBOE Project Coordinator. "Key personnel" are defined as those individuals identified by name or title in this Contract or in written communication from the Contractor.
25. Contract Modifications: This contract may be amended only by written amendment duly executed by both the UCBOE and the Contractor.
26. Relationship of Parties. The Contractor is an independent contractor and not an employee of the UCBOE. The conduct and control of the work will lie solely with the Contractor. This Contract shall not be construed as establishing a joint venture, partnership or any principal-agent relationship for any purpose between the Contractor and the UCBOE. Employees of the Contractor shall remain subject to the exclusive control and supervision of the Contractor, which is solely responsible for their compensation.
27. Advertisement. The Contract will not be used in connection with any advertising by the Contractor without prior written approval by the UCBOE.
28. Nondiscrimination. During the performance of this Contract, the Contractor shall not discriminate against or deny the Contract's benefits to any person on the basis of sexual orientation, national origin, race, ethnic background, color, religion, gender, age or disability.

29. Conflict of Interest. The Contractor represents and warrants that no member of the UCBOE or any of its employees or officers has a personal or financial interest or will benefit from the performance of this Contract or has any interest in any Contract, subcontract or other agreement related to this Contract. Contractor shall not permit any member of the UCBOE or any of its employees or officers to obtain a personal or financial interest or benefit from the performance of this Contract or to have any interest in any Contract, subcontract or other agreement related to this Contract, during the term of this Contract. The Contractor shall cause this paragraph to be included in all Contracts, subcontracts and other agreements related to this Contract.
30. Gratuities to UCBOE. The right of the Contractor to proceed may be terminated by written notice if the UCBOE determines that the Contractor, its agent or another representative offered or gave a gratuity to an official or employee of the UCBOE in violation of policies of the UCBOE.
31. Kickbacks to Contractor. The Contractor shall not permit any kickbacks or gratuities to be provided, directly or indirectly, to itself, its employees, subcontractors or subcontractor employees for the purpose of improperly obtaining or rewarding favorable treatment in connection with a UCBOE Contract or in connection with a subcontract relating to a UCBOE Contract. When the Contractor has grounds to believe that a violation of this clause may have occurred, the Contractor shall promptly report to the UCBOE in writing the possible violation.
32. Monitoring and Evaluation. The Contractor shall cooperate with the UCBOE, or with any other person or agency as directed by the UCBOE, in monitoring, inspecting, auditing or investigating activities related to this Contract. The Contractor shall permit the UCBOE to evaluate all activities conducted under this Contract. UCBOE has the right at its sole discretion to require that Contractor remove any employee of Contractor from UCBOE property and from performing services under this Contract following provision of notice to Contractor of the reasons for UCBOE's dissatisfaction with the services of Contractor's employee.
33. Financial Responsibility. The Contractor is financially solvent and able to perform under this Contract. If requested by the UCBOE, the Contractor agrees to provide a copy of its latest audited annual financial statements or other financial statements as deemed acceptable by the UCBOE's Finance Officer.
34. Dispute Resolution. At the option of the parties, disputes may be resolved by any method of ADR to which the parties agree in writing, including, but not limited to:
  - a. Mediation, pursuant to NCGS 7A-38.1 or the American Arbitration Association Mediation, or by written agreement of the parties.
  - b. Arbitration: pursuant to The Uniform Arbitration Act (NCGS 1-567.1 et seq.)

The award rendered by the arbitrator or arbitrators shall be final unless a party thereto gives written notice of its objection to the final award by arbitration within twenty (20) days from receipt of said decision. Upon giving of said notice the party objecting thereto may file suit concerning the dispute as if arbitration had never occurred. Unless legally required to do otherwise, the parties agree not to refer to the arbitration in the filing of any lawsuit or during its subsequent litigation, or to submit to the court any record of information concerning the arbitration.

35. No Third Party Benefits. This Contract shall not be considered by the Contractor to create any benefits on behalf of any third party. The Contractor shall include in all contracts, subcontracts or other agreements relating to this Contract an acknowledgment by the contracting parties that this Contract creates no third party benefits.

36. Confidentiality of Student Information. If, during the course of the Contractor's performance of this Contract, the Contractor should obtain any information pertaining to the students' official records, the Contractor agrees to keep any such information confidential and to not disclose or permit to be disclosed, directly or indirectly, to any person or entity any such student information. This Contract shall not be construed by either party to constitute a waiver of or to in any manner diminish the provisions for confidentiality of students' records. Additionally, pursuant to N.C.G.S. 115C-401.1, Prohibition on the Disclosure of Information about Students, it is unlawful for a person who enters into a contract with a local board of education to sell personally identifiable information that is obtained from a student as a result of that person's performance under the contract.
37. Background Checks. At the request of UCBOE's Project Coordinator, the Contractor (if an individual) or any individual employees of the Contractor shall submit to UCBOE criminal background check and drug testing procedures.
38. Jessica Lunsford Act. Contractors, subcontractors, consultants, sub-consultants, and vendors shall annually conduct a review of the State Sex Offender and Public Protection Registration Program, the State Sexually Violent Predator Registration Program, and the National Sex Offender Registry for all employees who will provide services under this contract. Any employee of the contractor, subcontractor, consultant, sub-consultant, or vendor found to be registered on any of the lists identified herein shall not perform any work under this contract and shall not be permitted to enter property owned by Union County Public Schools or Union County on behalf of Union County Public Schools. Failure to comply may result in legal action and termination of the contract for default.
39. E-verification. Contractor shall comply with the requirements of E-Verification NCGS Article 2 of Chapter 64A and the Iran Divestment Act of NCGS 147-86.58.
40. Force Majeure. If UCBOE is unable to perform its obligations or to accept the services or goods because of Force Majeure (as hereinafter defined), the time for such performance by UCBOE or acceptance of services will be equitably adjusted by allowing additional time for performance or acceptance of services equal to any periods of Force Majeure. "Force Majeure" shall mean any delays caused by acts of God, riot, war, terrorism, inclement weather, labor strikes, material shortages and other causes beyond the reasonable control of UCBOE.
41. Ownership of Documents. All rights in the work created pursuant to this Contract are owned by the UCBOE including, but not limited to, copyright, trade or service mark and licensing rights. Upon the termination or expiration of this Contract, any and all finished or unfinished documents and other materials produced by the Contractor pursuant to this Contract shall, at the request of the UCBOE, be turned over to UCBOE. Any technical knowledge or information of Contractor which Contractor shall have disclosed or may hereafter disclose to UCBOE shall not, unless otherwise specifically agreed upon in writing by UCBOE, be deemed to be confidential or proprietary information and shall be acquired by UCBOE as part of the consideration of this Contract free from any restrictions.
42. Contract Situs. All matters, whether sounding in contract or tort relating to the validity, construction, interpretation and enforcement of this Contract, will be determined in Union County, North Carolina. North Carolina law will govern the interpretation and construction of this Contract.
43. Entire Contract. This Contract constitutes and expresses the entire agreement and understanding between the parties concerning the subject matter of this Contract. This

document (including exhibits, if any), any purchase order used in connection with this Contract and any other document expressly incorporated in this Contract by reference supersede all prior and contemporaneous discussions, promises, representations, agreements and understandings relative to the subject matter of this Contract.

# UCPS

UNION COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Growing Possibilities...

PROJECT: IP CAMERA PLATFORM UPGRADE

REFERENCE NUMBER: 7-9709702

BID OPENING: 7/25/16 10:00 AM

BID TABULATION

COMPANY	AREA 1		AREA 2		AREA 3		BASE BID		AREA 4		AREA 5		TOTAL	
	AMOUNT	COMPLETION	AMOUNT	COMPLETION	AMOUNT	COMPLETION	AMOUNT	COMPLETION	AMOUNT	COMPLETION	AMOUNT	COMPLETION	DISCOUNT	TOTAL
<b>A3 COMMUNICATIONS</b> 5% Bid Bond: Yes Good Faith Eritoria: B Vendor Information/License: Yes, 30721-U/2512-COSA Everly Affidavit: Yes Item Divestment: Yes Non-Collation: Yes Subcontractor Form: Yes Addenda/Product Literature: Yes	\$151,512.52	28 CCD	\$127,835.06	20 CCD	\$126,859.96	20 CCD	\$ 98,453.09	16 CCD	\$127,896.24	20 CCD	\$ -	\$ 632,556.87		102 CCD
<b>CALL 24 SECURITY</b> 5% Bid Bond: Yes Good Faith Eritoria: B Vendor Information/License: Yes, 2854S, 1850CSA, 5783P1 Everly Affidavit: Yes Item Divestment: Yes Non-Collation: Yes Subcontractor Form: Yes Addenda/Product Literature: Yes	\$153,252.61	34 CCD	\$125,541.32	34 CCD	\$124,841.37	34 CCD	\$101,437.52	34 CCD	\$134,851.10	34 CCD	\$ -	\$ 640,023.92		34 CCD
<b>SECURITY 101</b> 5% Bid Bond: Yes Good Faith Eritoria: B Vendor Information/License: Yes, 1918CSA Everly Affidavit: Yes Item Divestment: Yes Non-Collation: Yes Subcontractor Form: Yes Addenda/Product Literature: Yes	\$156,975.44	7 CCD	\$129,682.30	5 CCD	\$128,787.06	5 CCD	\$101,123.44	4 CCD	\$130,382.13	5 CCD	\$ -	\$ 646,930.37		28 CCD
<b>SIMPLEX GRINNELL</b> 5% Bid Bond: Yes Good Faith Eritoria: A Vendor Information/License: Yes, BPN 000458P10 Everly Affidavit: Yes Item Divestment: Yes Non-Collation: Yes Subcontractor Form: Yes Addenda/Product Literature: Yes	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>UNIVERSAL PROTECTION SECURITY</b> 5% Bid Bond: No Good Faith Eritoria: B Vendor Information/License: Yes, 2430CSA Everly Affidavit: Yes Item Divestment: Yes Non-Collation: Yes Subcontractor Form: Yes Addenda/Product Literature: Yes	\$172,551.08	21 CCD	\$143,985.83	21 CCD	\$142,977.61	21 CCD	\$112,309.14	21 CCD	\$144,061.22	21 CCD	\$ 6,279.56	\$ 709,605.32		21 CCD